

PERIOD OF PERFORMANCE 11/1/2006 TO 11/30/2006

CDUKE	10605	NC Independent Third Party	
ODUIL		140 independent rima ranty	

CDUKE 10605	NC Independent Third Party		
Pamela Kozlowski		Date	Hours
	11/9 PWG meeting prep & post materials.	11/05/2006	1.00
	Attend PWG mtg.	11/09/2006	5.00
Pamela Kozlowski	Finaliza 40/47 DMC sate sainutas 8 paga Magle an dyaft saliability plan	44/40/2000	4.50
	Finalize 10/17 PWG mtg minutes & post. Work on draft reliability plan.	11/10/2006	4.50
	1/2 travel to and from Raleigh for PWG meeting.	11/09/2006	4.00
	PWG mtg follow-up. Draft sections, incorporate comments & drafting assignments, distribute next version of collaborative transmission plan to PWG. Post OSC mtg highlights. Comment on Oct status report.	11/14/2006	4.00
	Incorporate Progress drafting assignments and comments in draft collaborative transmission plan, distribute next version to PWG.	11/15/2006	1.00
	PWG teleconference call. Call w/Wodyka. Work on draft collaborative plan.	11/16/2006	2.50
	Incorporate comments & drafting assignments since 11/16 PWG telecon, distribute new draft of collaborative transmission plan to PWG.	11/20/2006	2.00
	Participate in PWG telecon. Phone calls w/Wodyka, Guy. Work on next draft of colloborative transmission plan and appendices.	11/21/2006	6.00
	Finalize draft of collaborative transmission plan and appendices for distribution to OSC. Phone calls w/Guy.	11/22/2006	2.00
	Draft 11/9 PWG minutes. Begin drafting Appendix E to the Collaborative Plan.	11/27/2006	2.00
	PWG teleconference call. Calls w/Wodyka. Work on draft collaborative plan.	11/29/2006	2.50
	Work on draft collaborative plan. Convert & post materials on NCTPC web site. Distribute materials to the PWG.	11/30/2006	3.00
	Employee Subtotal:		39.50
Richard Wodyka		Date	Hours
	Travel and attend the scheduled OSC meeting in Charlotte, NC	11/02/2006	8.00
Richard Wodyka		11/06/2006	2.00
	Follow up on PWG analysis.	11/07/2006	1.00
	Preparation for and participation in the PWG Meeting.	11/09/2006	6.00
	- operation of all a participation in the first modified		0.00
	Follow up on the PWG meeting action items including the drafting of the transmission plan report.	11/10/2006	2.00
	Preparation of the monthly project report and continued review and development of the 2006 Collaborative Transmission Plan draft report.	11/13/2006	2.00
	Finalize the monthly project report and continued review and development of the 2006 Collaborative Transmission Plan draft report.	11/14/2006	2.00
	Follow up on the transmission plan report development.	11/15/2006	1.00
	Preparation for and participation in the PWG teleconference meeting. Follow up on the drafting of the Transmission Plan report.	11/16/2006	3.00
	Follow up on the preparation of the Transmission Plan report.	11/17/2006	2.00
	Review and comment on the draft transmission plan report.	11/20/2006	2.00
	Preparation for, participation on, and follow up on the PWG teleconference meeting to review the draft transmission plan report.	11/21/2006	2.00
	Review and comment on the draft transmission plan report.	11/22/2006	2.00
	Preparation for the OSC meeting in Raleigh, NC	11/27/2006	2.00
		11/21/2000	2.00



PERIOD OF PERFORMANCE 11/1/2006 TO 11/30/2006

Attend the OSC meeting in Raleigh, NC	11/28/2006	8.00
Participate in the PWG teleconference meeting and follow up on items from the OSC meeting.	11/29/2006	4.00
Work on Transmission Plan Report	11/30/2006	4.00
Employee Subtotal:		53.00
TOTAL PROJECT HOURS		92.50

TOTAL MODEL MODIC					
TRAVEL DETAIL FOR 11/1/2006 TO 11/30/2006					
TOTAL TRAVEL EXPENSES AS FOLLOWS:					
Richard Wodyka Travel to OSC Meeting in Charlotte, NC	11/02/2006	1,322.49			
Richard Wodyka Travel to NCTCP OSC Meeting in Raleigh, NC	11/28/2006	440.07			
Pamela Kozlowski Travel to PWG Meeting in Charlotte, NC	11/09/2006	996.16			
GRAND TOTAL OF TRAVEL EXPENSES		\$2,728.72			