

PERIOD OF PERFORMANCE 6/1/2006 TO 6/30/2006

amela Kozlowski		Date	Hours
	Phone call w/Guy. Post PWG & OSC mtg materials.	06/15/2006	0.50
	Finalize 6/20 PWG agenda, post PWG mtg materials & prepare for PWG mtg.	06/19/2006	1.00
	Travel time & participate in PWG mtg.	06/20/2006	8.00
	Prepare for OSC meeting.	06/23/2006	1.00
	1/2 travel time to PWG mtg in Aberdeen.	06/19/2006	2.00
	Participate in OSC meeting. Revise templates for reporting identified projects. Draft, distribute & post 7/18 PWG agenda, 6/20 PWG action item list, 6/20 PWG mtg minutes, list follow-up items for 600 MW import cases, modify & prioritize potential solutio	06/27/2006	6.50
	Phone call w/Wodyka. Finalize TAG mtg announcement post on web & distribute to TAG distribution list. Ackknowledge registration requests for TAG mtg. Maintain TAG distribution list & access to web site.	06/30/2006	1.5
	Employee Subtotal:		20.5
Richard Wodvka		Date	Hour
	Review of PWG materials. Review and approval of monthly invoice material.	06/08/2006	1.0
	Preparation of the monthly status report and review of invoice materials.	06/12/2006	1.0
	Finalized monthly status report and emailed report and supporting information to Clay Norris for review.	06/13/2006	1.0
	Review and comment on PWG study materials	06/15/2006	1.0
	Review of PWG meeting materials for the June 20th meeting in Aberdeen, NC.	06/16/2006	2.0
	Travel to Aberdeen, NC for the PWG meeting.	06/19/2006	4.0
	Attend PWG meeting in Aberdeen, NC.	06/20/2006	8.0
	Follow up on items from the PWG meeting discussions.	06/21/2006	1.0
	Preparation for OSC meeting on June 27th in Raleigh, NC.	06/26/2006	2.0
	Preparation for and participation in the OSC meeting.	06/27/2006	4.0
	Follow up on OSC meeting discussion.	06/29/2006	0.5
	Final preparation of the TAG meeting notice and coordination of the meeting logistics.	06/30/2006	1.5

TOTAL PROJECT HOURS

Page 1 of 1

47.50